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About Diljale: Diljale is a 2006 Indian Hindi-language
comedy-drama film directed by Om Prakash Kher and
produced by Balaji Motion Pictures. It stars Ajay Devgn,
Sonali Bendre, and Paresh Rawal in lead roles. The original
soundtrack of the film was composed by Pritam
Chakraborty, with lyrics penned by Sameer. Diljale
became the first Indian film to win the Filmfare Award for
Best Film – Popular. The film released on 17 September
2006 to a positive response. The film was a success at the
box-office. Its soundtrack was also a success. Plot After
getting his wife killed in a road accident, Shyam looks for
revenge. Cast Ajay Devgn as Shyam Sonali Bendre as
Supriya Paresh Rawal as Rajeev Aditi Sharma as Durga
Kiran Juneja as Anjana Tiku Talsania as Madhav Shehzad
Khan as Vinod Sagarika as Gauri Ashutosh Rana as
Mukund Anupam Shyam as Gayaan Amit Sharma as
Inspector Release Diljale received favourable reviews upon
release. It was a commercial success with a six-week gross
of. Soundtrack The music and background score is
composed and sung by Pritam Chakraborty and lyrics are
by Sameer, the film is scored with the hit songs at various
stages of the movie. "Dil Jaan Diya" – Pritam Chakraborty
"Mali, Mali" - Lyrics - Sameer, Music – Gaurav Dua "Pyar
Na Mile Rishta Sa'ab -" - Lyrics - Sameer, Music – Gaurav
Dua "Dhoom" – Pritam Chakraborty "Nainon Ki Nazar" –

                               2 / 3



 

Pritam Chakraborty "Tara Tu Jyada Tu" – Lyrics - Sameer,
Music – Gaurav Dua "Ankhon Meeko" – Pritam
Chakraborty "Naina Jhoot Gayi" – Pritam Chakraborty
"Khatam Bolta" – Pritam Chakraborty "Aashiqana" -
Lyrics - Sameer, Music 570a42141b
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